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Luminaire type 
Square wall and ceiling luminaire with rounded 
corners. 
 
Applications 
For entrance areas, corridors, stairways, 
lounges, hotels, restaurants and residential 
zones. 
 
Mounting methods 
For wall or ceiling mounting. 
 
Optical system 
Matt diffuser with finely structured surface, 
uniformly illuminated. 
 
LED system 
Luminaire luminous flux 1400 lm, connected 
load 16 W, luminous efficiency of luminaire 88 
lm/W. Light colour warm white, colour 
temperature 3000 K, colour rendering index 
Ra > 80. Service life L80 (tq 25 °C) = 50,000 h. 
 
Luminaire body 
Luminaire body of sheet steel, white, powder-
coated. Diffuser of PMMA. Small construction, 
320mm x 320mm. Permissible ambient 
temperature (ta): -20 °C -  +25 °C. 
 
Electrical version 
With electronic transformer, switchable. 
 
Specification text 
Square wall and ceiling luminaire with rounded 
corners. For wall or ceiling mounting. Matt 
diffuser with finely structured surface, 
uniformly illuminated. Luminaire luminous flux 
1400 lm, connected load 16 W, luminous 
efficiency of luminaire 88 lm/W. Light colour 
warm white, colour temperature 3000 K, colour 
rendering index Ra > 80. Service life L80 (tq 25 
°C) = 50,000 h. Luminaire body of sheet steel, 
white, powder-coated. Diffuser of PMMA. 
Small construction, 320mm x 320mm. 
Permissible ambient temperature (ta): -20 °C -  
+25 °C. Safety class I, protection rating IP40, 
impact resistance IK02/0,2 J, glow wire 
resistance 650 °C. With electronic transformer, 
switchable. 
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